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PT MNC Digital Entertainment Tbk (“MSIN” or “the Company”), Indonesia’s largest content and digital 

entertainment group, is pleased to announce its inclusion in the FTSE Global Equity Index Small-Cap category, 

effective as of today, 24 March 2025. 

This milestone is a testament to MSIN’s outstanding position within the entertainment and digital media 

landscape. MSIN is renowned for its unparalleled content production and distribution, offering the best content 

across all genres with the highest yearly production output, supported by the most integrated and one stop 

studio infrastructure, called Movieland. Moreover, the Company boasts a vast talent pool and extensive social 

media operations, including leading music labels and publishing. 

As the country's leading digital entertainment powerhouse, MSIN operates the largest OTT streaming platform in 

Indonesia (AVOD - RCTI+ and SVOD - Vision+), serving more than 100 million active users, 3.3 million paying 

subscribers, and close to 2.1 billion plays. In the past year alone, the number of transactions on MSIN's OTT 

platforms has surged nearly fivefold, increasing from 1.1 million to 5.4 million transactions. In 2024, OTT revenue 

from both, advertisement and subscription have contributed 43% to MSIN’s total revenue that reached Rp3.5 

trillion. 

This inclusion in the FTSE Global Equity Index Small-Cap category highlights MSIN continued growth and 

leadership in the digital entertainment sector. The Company remains committed to enhancing its offerings and 

furthering its reach, ensuring a dynamic future as an industry leader.  

–

For further information, please contact: 
Investor Relations: 

Luthan Fadel Putra  
luthan.putra@mncgroup.com 

PT MNC DIGITAL ENTERTAINMENT TBK  

MNC Tower, 29th floor 
Jl. Kebon Sirih Kav 17 - 19 

Jakarta 10340 
Phone: 62-21 3913338 

Fax : 62-21 3910454 
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Disclaimer  

By accepting this Press Release, you are agreeing to be bound by the restrictions set out below.  Any failure to comply with 
these restrictions may constitute a violation of applicable securities laws. The information and opinions contained in this 
Press Release have not been independently verified, and no representation or warranty, expressed or implied, is made as 
to, and no reliance should be placed on the fairness, accuracy, completeness or correctness of, the information or opinions 
contained herein.  It is not the intention to provide, and you may not rely on this Press Release as providing, a complete or 
comprehensive analysis of the condition (financial or other), earnings, business affairs, business prospects, properties or 
results of operations of the company or its subsidiaries.  The information and opinions contained in this Press Release are 
provided as at the date of this presentation and are subject to change without notice.  Neither the company (including any 
of its affiliates, advisors and representatives) nor the underwriters (including any of their respective affiliates, advisors or 
representatives) shall have any responsibility or liability whatsoever (in negligence or otherwise) for the accuracy or 
completeness of, or any errors or omissions in, any information or opinions contained herein nor for any loss howsoever 
arising from any use of this presentation. In addition, the information contained in this Press Release contains projections 
and forward-looking statements that reflect the company’s current views with respect to future events and financial 
performance.  These views are based on a number of estimates and current assumptions which are subject to business, 
economic and competitive uncertainties and contingencies as well as various risks and these may change over time and in 
many cases are outside the control of the company and its directors.  No assurance can be given that future events will 
occur, that projections will be achieved, or that the company’s assumptions are correct.  Actual results may differ materially 
from those forecasts and projected. This Press Release is not and does not constitute or form part of any offer, invitation or 
recommendation to purchase or subscribe for any securities and no part of it shall form the basis of or be relied upon in 
connection with any contract, commitment or investment decision in relation thereto.  Any investment in any securities 
issued by the company or its affiliates should be made solely on the basis of the final offer document issued in respect of 
such securities. 


